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Yamaha Sousaphone 6 $5,690.55 $34,143.30 30 Days $5,700.40 $34,202.40 21-45 days $5,777.00 $34,662.00 $44,228.00 $5,808.00 $34,848.00 1-2 Weeks $5,920.00 $35,520.00 120-160 days $5,990.00 $35,940.00 12/2020 $7,303.66 $43,821.96 ETA @ ARO No Bid $8,800.00 $52,800.00 10-22 days No Bid
Yamaha Trumpet 4 $1,822.15 $7,288.60 30 Days $1,919.80 $7,679.20 21-45 days $1,911.00 $7,644.00 10 daus $1,975.00 $7,900.00 1-2 Weeks $1,995.00 $7,980.00 30 days $1,999.00 $7,996.00 10/2020 $2,312.00 $9,248.00 In stock No Bid $3,520.00 $14,080.00 10-22 days $1,989.00 $7,956.00 7-15 days
Yamaha Flute 2 $1,316.75 $2,633.50 30 Days $1,375.40 $2,750.80 21-45 days $1,411.00 $2,822.00 $44,197.00 $1,488.00 $2,976.00 1-2 Weeks $1,430.00 $2,860.00 120 days $1,440.00 $2,880.00 10/2020 $1,762.20 $3,524.40 In stock No Bid $3,050.00 $6,100.00 10-22 days $1,408.00 $2,816.00 $44,228.00

TOTAL Yamaha $44,065.40 $44,632.40 $45,128.00 $45,724.00 $46,360.00 $46,816.00 $56,594.36 No Bid $72,980.00 Did not bid all items

Adams Percussion 1 $3,885.81 $3,885.81 30 Days $3,819.90 $3,819.90 21-45 days $3,766.00 $3,766.00 10 days $4,138.00 $4,138.00 1-2 Weeks $3,970.00 $3,970.00 30 days No Bid No Bid $4,699.99 $4,699.99 ETA @ ARO $4,100.00 $4,100.00 30 Days $6,050.00 $6,050.00 10-22 days No bid
Conn Horn 1 $2,505.99 $2,505.99 30 Days $2,475.85 $2,475.85 21-45 days $2,470.00 $2,470.00 14 days $2,675.00 $2,675.00 1-2 Weeks $2,565.00 $2,565.00 30-60 days No Bid No Bid $3,167.51 $3,167.51 In stock $2,620.00 $2,620.00 30 Days $4,500.00 $4,500.00 10-22 days $2,490.00 $2,490.00 7-15 days
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